
 
 
 
 
 

Flying Cows Stay Undefeated over the Jersey Shore Breaks 140 - 108 

 
Saturday April 12th, 2025 
Frederick, MD 

The Flying Cows proved once again why they’re the team to beat, staying undefeated with a 
controlling 140–108 victory over the Jersey Shore Breaks. All eyes were on Chris Smith, a 
Breaks All-Star who’s been averaging 19.5 points per game this season. While Smith showed 
flashes of brilliance, the depth and dominance of the Cows were too much to overcome.  

The tone was set early as the Flying Cows stormed out to a 12–3 run, showcasing elite ball 
movement and suffocating defense. Ronald Scott got things flowing early, dishing out 4 assists 
in the opening frame and finding teammates in rhythm. The ball moved beautifully, and scoring 
came from all over. He managed to snag his second consecutive double-double putting up 19 
points, 14 assists, and 5 rebounds.  

But it was Javon Adams who quickly took over this game. The scoring machine notched 13 
points in the first quarter alone, continuing his hot streak with his fourth 30-point performance in 
five games. He also had 8 assists and 14 rebounds.  

In the second quarter, Kyle Steward made his presence felt on the defensive end, contesting 
shots on the perimeter and forcing turnovers. Despite Captain of the Breaks Chris Smith, who 
knocked down a pair of tough bank shots, the Breaks couldn’t find consistent help elsewhere. 

Meanwhile, Ed Dyson contributed 8 points in the second quarter alone, including a powerful 
baseline dunk that hinted at what was to come later. 

Coming out of halftime Flying Cows 59 – Breaks 42, the Flying Cows hit another gear. Transition 
offense became their best weapon, with Damien Daniels pushing the pace and setting up easy 
buckets. Daniels quietly pieced together a stellar game with 10 points and 10 assists, making all 
the right plays. Kyle Steward began cooking on offense, knocking down his trademark 
spin-move mid-range jumper. He finished with 21 points, 8 rebounds, and 2 steals, a true 
two-way performance. 

Chris Smith fought to keep the Breaks alive, finishing with 33 points, 7 rebounds, and 9 assists, 
but the Flying Cows kept pouring it on. By the End of 3rd the Flying Cows had a 30 point lead. 



Even with the large cushion, the Flying Cows never let off the gas. Ed Dyson brought the house 
down with a vicious poster dunk on a Breaks forward, electrifying the crowd. Dyson ended the 
night with 27 points, putting an exclamation point on an already dominant performance. 

The scoring didn’t slow down in the fourth, with the Cows dropping 44 more points in the final 
quarter. Contributions came from all over, including Martavian Payne, who added 12 points and 
4 rebounds. Joe Bradshaw was an unsung hero, crashing the glass, and doing the dirty work 
that helped the Cows performance, finishing with a hard-earned 12 points and 10 rebounds. 

Final Score: Flying Cows 140 – Jersey Shore Breaks 108 

The Jersey Shore Breaks fall to 2-10 and will travel back to New Jersey to prepare for a tough 
matchup against the Virginia Valley Vipers. Despite Chris Smith’s strong return, the Breaks’ 
weaknesses, especially in the paint and on the glass, were exposed by the league’s most 
dominant interior team. 

The Flying Cows are still undefeated. Still the scariest team in the TBL. Up next, they take on 
the Capital Seahawks at home. Tip-off is set for 3:00 PM at Hood College. With the all star 
break approaching, the Flying Cows are locked in and looking to secure their 13th straight win 
and maintain their flawless record.  

Following this weekend, the Cows will host the TBL All-Star Weekend in Frederick, MD, at the 
Woodsboro Bank Arena at Hood College on April 18th and 19th. They will face the TBL All-Star 
team on Saturday night (April 19th) at 7 p.m. In addition, Frederick will host the All-Star Friday 
Night festivities on Friday evening at 7 p.m., and a free Jr. TBL Youth Basketball Clinic on 
Saturday at 9 a.m. 

See Flying Cows vs. Breaks Box Score Here 
 
 

https://hosted.dcd.shared.geniussports.com/TBBL/en/match/2623614/boxscore?

